
Rotary News & Notes
Announcements:

Dragonboats

Congratulations to everyone who 
paddled on the Southwest 
Strokers Dragonboat team last 
Saturday as part of the UW 
Oshkosh Fall Fest. Not only did 
they spend a beautiful day on the 
Fox River and inside the Leach 
Amphitheater, they also were 
crowned winners of the Not For 
Profit Division. Way to go! The 
Dragonboat Race and Festival is 
an annual event that raises 
money for the YMCA Strong 
Kids Program and UW Oshkosh 
scholarships. Mark your 
calendars for September 22, 
2012 for the 7th annual race. 

Crop Hunger Walk

The Oshkosh North High School 
Interact Club will be hosting 

Crop Hunger Walk on Sunday, 
October 2 at County Park in 
Oshkosh. Registration starts at 2 
p.m. with the walk at 2:30 p.m. 
Walkers can choose a route of 1, 
3, 5 miles (or more). For 
information, participation and 
pledge forms contact Pastor John 
Hobbins at (920) 948-5175 or 
jfhobbins@gmail.com. Proceeds 
will benefit the Oshkosh Area 
Community Food Pantry.

PALs Program

Volunteers are needed to help at 
our PALs school - Roosevelt 
Elementary School. People are 
needed to read to and with 
students, participate in the Lunch 
& Learn program, and a variety 
of other opportunities. Contact 
Marcus Butts for more 
information.

Highway 44 Clean Up

The last Highway 44 clean-up of 
the year is scheduled for 
Saturday, October 8. Meet at the
Winnebago Home Builder’s 
Association office, 4091 
Highway 91 at 8 a.m. John 
Holdorf will provide breakfast
following the clean up. 

Topic: “John Holdorf: Old Glory Honor 
Flight”
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Calendar of Events
Upcoming Programs

Oct. 5

Oct. 12

Oct. 19

Club Business

Kristyna Williams, Affinity 
Visiting Nurses

Fr. Alex Busuttil, Alto 
Caymo Mission, Peru

Recurring Events
2nd Mon.
(Oct. 10)

Club Board Meeting

4:00 – 5:30, Robbins

Other Rotary Events
Oct. 8

Oct. 20

Highway 44 Clean Up

Bowling FUN-Raiser
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Bowling FUN-Raiser

The annual Bowling Fun-raiser 
is Thursday, October 20. We are 
looking for individual bowlers 
and teams to participate. 

Funds raised through this event 
will mostly stay with our club –
as opposed to previous years 
where money was distributed to 
pre-selected organization. Our 
goal is to help this event 
continue to grow so please 
recruit bowlers and teams of 
bowlers. For more information, 
contact Marlin.

Rotaract Clubs

John Hobbins and Melody 
Wollangk are looking for 
students and young professionals 
aged 18-30 to start a Rotaract 
Club in Oshkosh. If you know of 
anyone intersted please pass 
along their names.

Rotaract Clubs exists at both 
Oshkosh West and North high 
Schools and meet on a regular 
basis. If you’d like to attend a 
meeting or get involved, please 
contact John or Melody.

Golf Outing

More than a dozen golfers
participated in the Southwest 
Rotary Club’s golf outing at 
Westhaven Golf Course. Thanks 
to everyone who enjoyed the 
afternoon on the course. While 
many awards were handed out to 
golfers, the top prize went to 
Tom Hallquist for – “oldest 

clubs on the course that day” 
(check out the photos below). 
This is going to be an annual 
event – so circle the third Friday 
in September for the next club 
golf outing.

Construction Reminder

The intersection of Highways 21 
and 41 are under major 
construction – it may cause 
delays in getting to our weekly 
meeting. Please plan 
accordingly. 

Weekly Invocations

September Kim Johnson     

Weekly Greeters                                            

September 28   Julie Fevola

October 5   Terry Chier & Lorraine 
Yarbrough

October 12     Barb Herzog & Marcus 
Butts

The Hub – Info Please!
hub@oshkoshrotarysouthwest.org

The District Website
http://rotary6270.org

Visit RI’s Website
http://www.rotary.org

Have information for The 
HUB?  Submit it no later than 
Noon on Tuesday to
Jeffp@grandoperahouse.org

      

Of the things we think, say 
or do:

1. Is it the truth?
2. Is it fair to all concerned?
3. Will it build good will 

and better friendships?
4. Will it be beneficial to all 

concerned?

The Four 
Way Test
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