
Rotary News & Notes
Announcements:

Dragonboats

Thank you to everyone who 
paddled away their Saturday at 
the annual Dragonboat Race and
Festival. While the Southwest 
Strokers didn’t take home the
big prize this year, we did have a 
wonderful time on the Fox 
River. Thanks to everyone to 
paddled, participated or just 
cheered on the team! 

Bowling FunRaiser

The 5th annual Southwest Rotary 
Club Bowling FunRaiser will be 
held on Thursday October 21 
from 5 to 10 p.m. at the Electric 
Lounge bowling lanes, 405 
Washington. Save the date and 
make plans to bowl the night 
away while raising funds for 
deserving local charities, 
including the Southwest Rotary 
Club, Cerebral Palsy, Take 5, 
D.A.R.E., the Community Food 
Pantry and the Girl Scouts. More 
details are coming soon – keep 
watching The Hub and your 
tables for sign-up information. 

Three Club Social

All three Oshkosh-based Rotary 
Clubs are getting together prior 
to the October 2nd Gallery Walk 
in downtown Oshkosh.  Hors 
d’oeurves and beverages will be 
served from 4:30 to 6 p.m. at 
100 N. Main Street. This is also 
an opportnity to check out 
progress on the Oshkosh 
Community Mural project. 
Watch for a sign-up sheet.

Oshkosh Oktoberfest

Don’t miss out on the innaugrual 
Oshkosh Oktoberfest, October 1-
3 at the Leach Amphitheatre in 
downtown Oshkosh. Members of 
Southwest Rotary will be 
working a concession stand 
seling special sodas and coffee. 
Their hard work will net our club 
a nice little return. So stopy by 
and enjoy music, food and 
drinks. Say hello to your fellow 
Rotarians, and help Wisconsin’s 
Event City welcome another 
signature event to our city. 

For details, visit: 
http://www.oshkoshoktoberfest.c
om/
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Calendar of Events
Upcoming Programs

Oct. 6

Oct. 13

Oct. 20

Oct. 27

LeRoy Butler, former 
Green Bay Packer

Club Business, 
Vocational Service

Roy Duxstad & Eileen 
Connolly-Keesler “Rotary 
Foundation Updates”

Mai Kao Xiong, "My Year 
in Taiwan"

Recurring Events
3rd Mon.
(Oct. 18)

Club Board Meeting
4:00 – 5:30, Robbins

Other Rotary Events

Oct. 21

Dec. 15

Bowling FunRaiser

Club Holiday Party
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New Member Proposals

The following individuals have
been recommended for
membership by the Board of
Directors:

Name: John Hobbins
Proposed by: John Hazelberg
Occupation: Lead Pastor, First 
United Methodist Church
Second Posting

Celebration of Lights

The Celebration of Lights team 
wants to thank everyone in 
advance for the great interest 
and support in this year’s event. 
Initial support has been  great –
but much more is needed to 
continue this holiday tradition. 

Planning for the annual 
Celebration of Lights in 
Menominee Park is underway. 
See Karen or Deb for more 
information on how you can get 
involved. Celebration of Lights 
begins on Thanksgiving and runs 
through January 1, 2011. 

Harlem Ambassadors

The Harlem Ambassadors are 
coming to Oshkosh North High 
School Gym on September 29 as 
a fundraiser for the United Way.
Tickets are $8 for adults and $6 
for children. 

2011 District Conference

The Hartland-Lake Country 
Rotary Club would like to 

extend an invitation to you to 
attend the 2011 District 6270 
Conference, “Building Your 
Rotary Club in the 21st Century” 
on May 13-15 at the Country 
Springs Conference Center and 
Water Park in Pewaukee. 
On the agenda: May 13: district 
golf outing, reception and dinner 
at Country Springs Grand Ball 
Room and club hospitality 
suites; May 14: continental 
breakfast, break-out sessions and 
House of Friendship, dinner, 
keynote speaker and live 
entertainment; May 15: 
continental breakfast, interfaith 
service and closing session.

Club Holiday Party

The Oshkosh Southwest Rotary 
Club’s annual Holiday Party will 
be held on December 15. Mark 
your calendars!

Winefeast 2011

A date for the 2011 edition of 
Winefeast has been selected. 
The Oshkosh Southwest Rotary 
Club and the Oshkosh Boys & 
Girls Club will present this 
annual fundraiser on April 2, 
2011.  Keep watching for more 
details. 

Thank you ThedaCare

Julie Pollnow reported that 
ThedaCare made a $1,000 
donation to our club in exchange 
for our partial sponsorship of 
their concession stand at a recent 
charity event. That’s a quick 
grand to support our programs. 
Thanks! 

Weekly Invocations

October      

Weekly Greeters                                            
Sept. 29 Karen Fredrick & Bryan 
Hochstein

Oct. 6 John Davis

Oct. 13 Marcus Butts & Bonnie 
Behnke

Oct. 20 Doug Seefeld & Jim Putman 

Oct. 27 Colleen Merrill & Steve 
Seidel

The Hub – Info Please!
hub@oshkoshrotarysouthwest.org

The District Website
http://rotary6270.org

Visit RI’s Website
http://www.rotary.org

Have information for The 
HUB?  Submit it no later than 
Noon on Tuesday to
Jeffp@grandoperahouse.org

      

Of the things we think, say 
or do:

1. Is it the truth?
2. Is it fair to all concerned?
3. Will it build good will 

and better friendships?
4. Will it be beneficial to all 

concerned?

The Four 
Way Test
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