
Rotary News & Notes
Announcements:

Rotary Three Club Social

Mark your calendars for Friday, 
January 21 from 6 to 9 p.m. for a 
special social with all Oshkosh 
Rotarians at the Grand Opera 
House’s Grand Lounge, 100 
High Avenue. Cost is $12.50 per 
person and includes heavy 
appetizers and desserts. There 
will be a cash bar available.

New Member Social

Rotarians – make plans to meet 
and greet new members of the 
Oshkosh Southwest Rotary 
Club. We’ve seen plenty of new 
faces in the past year and its time 
we get to know them better. Join 
your fellow club members for a 
social at Dublin’s Irish Pub, 
2070 W. 9th Avenue, from 6 to 9 
p.m. on Wednesday, February 9, 
2011. For more details, talk to 
Scott Woldt. 

Second City at The Grand

Tom Hallquist is helping to 
organize a Rotary outing to the 

Grand Opera House for a 
performance by the Second City, 
improve comedy troupe out of 
Chicago. The show is scheduled 
for April 9 at 7 p.m. Rotarians 
are invited to come early for a 
reception in the new Grand 
Lounge (food and cash bar) The 
Lounge will open at 4:45 p.m. 
for Rotarians (and open at 6 p.m. 
for the general public). Food 
costs are still to be determined. 
To reserve your tickets contact 
Tom Hallquist at 
tom.hallquist@gmail.com. 

Southwest Rotary on 
Facebook

Make sure to check out our 
club’s Facebook Page. You’ll 
find it at www.facebook.com, 
search Oshkosh Rotary 
Southwest. We also have a new 
website getting ready to launch 
with many great improvements. 
Thanks to Craig Burnett for his 
hard work on the website project 
– we are very excited to see what 
is in store for the future of 
Southwest Rotary on the 
internet! 

Topic: “Peter Moll: Oshkosh Airport 
Director”
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Secretary: Gerald Krueger
Treasurer: Kathy Hanson
Foundation: David Omachinski
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Sgt-at-Arms: Jim Chitwood
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Club Service Chairs
Scott Woldt & Emily Dunham

Community Service Chairs
Mike Scott & Lori Davis
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Dist. 6270
  Dist. Gov.: Paul Decker
  Zone-B A.D.G.: Karen Fredrick
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Calendar of Events
Upcoming Programs

Jan. 26

Feb. 2

Feb. 9

Environmental Awards

Club Business

Khurram Ahmad “The 
Ahmadiyya Movement in 
Islam, Inc”

Recurring Events
2rd Mon.
(Feb. 14)

Club Board Meeting
4:00 – 5:30, Robbins

Other Rotary Events

Jan. 21

Feb. 9

Feb. 25 
& 26

Rotary 3-Club Social 

New Member Social

4th Annual Battle on Bago
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4th Annual Battle on Bago

We are less than 6 weeks away 
from the 4th Annual Battle on 
Bago. The fishing prizes are set, 
but we are still looking for raffle 
prizes. Contact Glenn Curran or 
a member of the committee to 
make a donation. 

Thanks to everyone who has 
stepped forward in the past week 
with donations – a few more 
would be greatly appreciated! 

There is now a Battle on Bago 
Facebook Page – go “like” it for 
a chance to win prizes. 

VOLUNTEERS – are still 
needed. Watch for a sign up 
sheet in early February. All 
volunteers will receive Ice 
Creepers (metal thingy’s for 
boots for the layperson) which 
will prevent slippage on the ice. 

If you are interested in ordering 
a hooded sweatshirt, long sleeve 
shirt, hat, beanie or other 
merchandise contact a 
committee member ASAP! 

For more information on the 
event, visit 
www.battleonbago.org and don’t 
forget to mark your calendars for 
February 25 & 26 for fun on 
Lake Winnebago.

New Member Proposals

The following individuals have
been recommended for
membership by the Board of
Directors:
Name:  Nate Olson
Proposed by:  Lisa Metz
Occupation: Attorney- Olson 
Legal Group, LLC.
Second Posting

Name: Peter Cernohous
Proposed by: Nicole Peterson
Occupation: Retired Principal 
Oshkosh School District.  
Second Posting

Winefeast

The Winefeast Committee is still 
looking for sponsorships.  Silent 
auction items are also needed.
Please Contact Mike Scott  or 
Tracy Ogden if you have any 
suggestions or wish to make a 
donation.

And - Thanks to Festival Foods 
there is a new twist to Winefeast 
– a “Groceries for a Year”
raffle! 

Winefeast is April 2, 2011. Mark 
your calendars.

Weekly Invocations

January Vicki Beltran    

February        Dick Ames

Weekly Greeters                                            

Jan. 19 Bob Campbell & John Davis

Jan. 26 Glenn Curran & Lori Davis

Feb. 2 Rich Meyer & Nicole 
Peterson

Feb. 9 Steve Seidl & Kelly Mundell

The Hub – Info Please!
hub@oshkoshrotarysouthwest.org

The District Website
http://rotary6270.org

Visit RI’s Website
http://www.rotary.org

Have information for The 
HUB?  Submit it no later than 
Noon on Tuesday to
Jeffp@grandoperahouse.org

      

Of the things we think, say 
or do:

1. Is it the truth?
2. Is it fair to all concerned?
3. Will it build good will 

and better friendships?
4. Will it be beneficial to all 

concerned?

The Four 
Way Test
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